
PUBLIC AUCTION OF TAX DEFAULTED PROPERTIES -  MAY 23, 2008

SALE ASSESSEE PARCEL NO. NOTICE DEF. NO MIN PRICE SOLD FOR STATE COUNTY ADVERT. RECORDING REDEMPTION EXCESS SOLD TO:
 LOT BK/PG YEAR PORTION PORTION FEE TAXES PROCEEDS

 
1 GOLDEN GATE PETROLEUM 002-232-04 1998-12785 020657 13,400.00     10,598.75          REDEEMED 5/22/08

1992-93 35.00                 

2 R.E. DEJUNG 006-053-21 2007-12292 05717 5,700.00       7,107.73            REMOVED - DECEASED
1999-00 35.00                 REDEEMED 5/7/08

3 LAWERENCE A. BROOKS 012-611-63 2007-12294 09222 1,300.00       899.93               REDEEMED 4/22/08
2001-02 35.00                 

4 LORIN E. SAWYERS 014-310-15 1998-12824 044881 2,300.00       SOLD AT AUCTION - BUYER
1992-93 BACKED OUT

5 MICHAEL GARFIELD 1/3 032-020-53 2007-12299 19729 4,400.00       3,742.69            REDEEMED 5/19/08
2000-01 35.00                 

6 LAURIN D. SR. & HELEN V. SERVI 032-292-1305 2007-12300 20612 1,400.00       910.30               REDEEMED 4/28/08
2001-02 35.00                 

7 RONALD G. & JOANNE V. BIRCHARD 033-240-27 2428/553 008648 19,100.00     18,062.53          REDEEMED 5/19/08
1991-92 35.00                 

8 JENNIFER LYN BRANDON 035-470-06 2007-12302 23508 5,000.00       3,521.29            REDEEMED 3/26/08
2001-02 35.00                 

9 DAVID TORREY 1/2 036-200-80 2007-12303 23848 5,000.00       4,134.25            REDEEMED 5/16/08
2001-02 35.00                 

10 DARRELL PIKE 050-510-04 2007-12304 29041 3,200.00       3,200.00 1.50 150.00 83.37 11.00 2,905.63            0.00 BALDEMAR ALVAREZ
2001-02 35.00 3.85 PO BOX 504

13.50 TALMAGE, CA 95481

11 ESTATE OF VIOLET HENZE 053-360-04 2007-12305 29853 4,200.00       3,263.64            REDEEMED 1/25/08
2001-02 35.00                 

12 JOYCE LAURENE TETREAULT 095-370-1101 2007-12306 32362 1,200.00       REMOVED - DECEASED
2001-02



13 DUNG SY NGUYEN/ 096-162-1301 2008-00684 32589 4,200.00       NO BID
2001-02

14 WESTERN NETWORK SOLUTIONS INC 096-311-1401 2007-12308 33206 1,400.00       REMOVED - DECEASED
2001-02

15 INTERNATIONAL MARKETING 096-313-0401 2007-12309 33052 1,900.00       NO BID
INSTITUTE 2001-02

16 EDWARD G. & VICTORIA A. LUCERO 097-075-0901 2007-12310 33348 2,800.00       2,095.11            REDEEMED 5/22/08
2001-02 35.00                 

17 TIMOTHY LINCOLN COLLINS 097-123-0601 2007-12311 33469 18,000.00     270,000.00 1.50 150.00 178.47 11.00 17,641.49          251,977.04 DONALD W. WRIGHT
2001-02 35.00 297.00 2715 VICTORIA DRIVE

5.50 SANTA ROSA, CA 95407

18 MARIO P. & VICTORIA N. FERNANDEZ 097-133-0201 2007-12425 33531 3,100.00       NO BID
2001-02

19 ENRICO N. & ROSE V. DEGUZMAN 097-274-1001 2007-13977 82711 4,300.00       NO BID
2001-02

20 VELDA V. MARSHALL 097-295-0301 2007-12426 34080 1,500.00       NO BID
2001-02

21 DOUGLAS C. TRAUSCH 1/2 098-352-1501 2007-12427 36123 4,300.00       NO BID
2001-02

22 WINSTON & CORAZON CRUZ 099-043-0801 2007-12428 36285 3,000.00       NO BID
2001-02

23 MA LUCIA B. DELACRUZ 1/2 099-044-0901 2007-12429 36295 3,600.00       NO BID
2001-02

24 ALFONSO P. & ANITA I. MARQUEZ 099-081-0701 2007-12430 36438 3,300.00       NO BID
2001-02

25 ANGELI C. ESPANOL 100-062-0401 2007-12431 36949 3,200.00       NO BID
2001-02

26 VICTOR T. & CELESTINA E. 100-072-1301 2007-12432 37019 4,800.00       3,965.82            REDEEMED 5/22/08
SUMAGAYSAY 2001-02 35.00                 



27 WESTERN NETWORK SOLUTIONS INC 100-152-0801 2007-12433 37316 2,400.00       NO BID
2001-02

28 DAVID & SONIA MANCIAS RAMIREZ 100-175-0201 2007-12434 37517 4,300.00       NO BID
2001-02

29 THEODORA DOUEX 100-321-1701 2007-12435 38277 3,700.00       2,917.38            REDEEMED 2/21/08
2001-02 35.00                 

30 JON W. BELL TRUST 142-010-0905 2007-12436 46351 1,000.00       5,100.00 1.50 150.00 178.46 11.00 726.41               3,978.63 SANDY GUTIERREZ AND KIRA REINHART
2001-02 35.00 6.05 1179 SIERRA VISTA WAY

19.00 LAFAYETTE, CA 94549

31 JAMES ROBERT & LOIS JEAN 143-090-13 2007-12439 46712 6,100.00       4,708.64            REDEEMED 5/7/08
STALNAKER 2001-02 35.00                 

32 RONALD P. & MARGARET T. CARFI 180-160-04 2004-15170 56440 3,700.00       119,000.00 1.50 150.00 178.46 11.00 3,336.39            115,269.15 WILLIAM REGE 1/2
1998-99 35.00 130.90 TERRY BRAY 1/4

18.50 TAMMY BRAY 1/4
5959 HWY 175
HOPLAND, CA 95449

TOTALS 397,300.00 6.00 600.00 618.76 44.00 65,733.06          371,224.82
140.00 437.80 195.00               

56.50 455.00               
24,609.92          
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